
Sun Sep 17, 2023

06:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Fun and Midway Games 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

07:00 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Skeletal Replicas, Ice Buckets & Servers, Dining Chairs, Inground Pools  

A look under the microscope to discover how skeletal replicas, ice buckets and servers, dining chairs, and inground 
pools are made.

07:30 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Automatic Sliding Doors, Gin, Firearms Restoration 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how automatic sliding doors are manufactured 
and gin is produced.

08:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1970 International Scout 

Mike hunts down a 1970 International Harvester Scout 800A; Ant restores it to glory by rebuilding a leaky transfer 
case, fixing the steering, replacing out of date wipers, and fixing the interior.

09:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

The Winds Of Trade 

Sea-life painter Guy Harvey enlists ATM to build a nearly 40,000-gallon aquarium for the Trade Winds Resort in St. 
Pete Beach, Florida that guests can dive into; the General threatens to retire after the way he is treated in Las 
Vegas.

10:00 OUTBACK OPAL HUNTERS Repeat WS PG

The Blacklighters attempt a dangerous night-time dig. Heavy storms could destroy the Boulder Boys' season, while 
the Young Guns lose valuable opal.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

11:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Fun and Midway Games 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

12:00 FLYING WILD ALASKA Repeat WS PG

Bush Brawl 

There is trouble when a violent snowstorm hits, shutting down western Alaska and leaving Era pilots circling. 
Meanwhile, Ariel's flying lesson ends in disaster.

Cons.Advice: Themes, Mild Coarse Language

13:00 HOW THE UNIVERSE WORKS Repeat WS PG

Secret History of Pluto 

Astronomers discovered a host of other icy objects orbiting around Pluto. Renewed interest was piqued, especially 
after a New Horizons probe took some high-resolution photos of Pluto in 2015.

Cons.Advice: Themes
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Sun Sep 17, 2023

14:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1970 International Scout 

Mike hunts down a 1970 International Harvester Scout 800A; Ant restores it to glory by rebuilding a leaky transfer 
case, fixing the steering, replacing out of date wipers, and fixing the interior.

15:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Skeletal Replicas, Ice Buckets & Servers, Dining Chairs, Inground Pools  

A look under the microscope to discover how skeletal replicas, ice buckets and servers, dining chairs, and inground 
pools are made.

15:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Automatic Sliding Doors, Gin, Firearms Restoration 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how automatic sliding doors are manufactured 
and gin is produced.

16:00 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

2017 Ford Mustang GT 

A mum seeking excitement in her life wants a muscle car. The gang helps her find a used 2016 Ford Mustang GT 
and installs a few upgrades for maximum horsepower.

16:30 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Fun and Midway Games 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

17:30 TANKED Repeat WS PG

The Winds Of Trade 

Sea-life painter Guy Harvey enlists ATM to build a nearly 40,000-gallon aquarium for the Trade Winds Resort in St. 
Pete Beach, Florida that guests can dive into; the General threatens to retire after the way he is treated in Las 
Vegas.
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Sun Sep 17, 2023

18:30 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1970 International Scout 

Mike hunts down a 1970 International Harvester Scout 800A; Ant restores it to glory by rebuilding a leaky transfer 
case, fixing the steering, replacing out of date wipers, and fixing the interior.

19:30 SECRET SPACE ESCAPES Repeat WS PG

Stranded 

A power failure occurs on the ISS forcing the crew to consider abandoning the station, although damage has been 
found on the shuttle that could comprise them upon reentry. During the first spacewalk a cosmonaut is nearly 
stranded after a suit malfunction.

20:30 KILLERS OF THE COSMOS Repeat WS PG

Little Green Men 

Aliens could be lethal killers who want to invade and plunder our world; a team of experts investigate extra-terrestrial 
beings and their threat to human life.

Cons.Advice: Themes

21:30 NASA'S UNEXPLAINED FILES Repeat WS PG

Vanishing Spaceman 

A look is taken at exclusive NASA footage and firsthand accounts of mysterious flying objects from astronauts and 
scientists.

Cons.Advice: Themes

22:30 GHOST ASYLUM WS M

Moundsville Penitentiary 

Murder, torture, rape, and inhuman conditions caused thousands of deaths and endless suffering at Moundsville 
Penitentiary. The Tennessee Wraith Chasers hope to trap the feuding spirits of a white supremacist and the head of 
a biker gang.

Cons.Advice: References to Violence, Supernatural Themes

23:30 SECRET SPACE ESCAPES Repeat WS PG

Stranded 

A power failure occurs on the ISS forcing the crew to consider abandoning the station, although damage has been 
found on the shuttle that could comprise them upon reentry. During the first spacewalk a cosmonaut is nearly 
stranded after a suit malfunction.

00:30 KILLERS OF THE COSMOS Repeat WS PG

Little Green Men 

Aliens could be lethal killers who want to invade and plunder our world; a team of experts investigate extra-terrestrial 
beings and their threat to human life.

Cons.Advice: Themes

01:30 NASA'S UNEXPLAINED FILES Repeat WS PG

Vanishing Spaceman 

A look is taken at exclusive NASA footage and firsthand accounts of mysterious flying objects from astronauts and 
scientists.

Cons.Advice: Themes
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Sun Sep 17, 2023

02:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Skeletal Replicas, Ice Buckets & Servers, Dining Chairs, Inground Pools  

A look under the microscope to discover how skeletal replicas, ice buckets and servers, dining chairs, and inground 
pools are made.

03:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Automatic Sliding Doors, Gin, Firearms Restoration 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how automatic sliding doors are manufactured 
and gin is produced.

03:30 GHOST ASYLUM Repeat WS M

Moundsville Penitentiary 

Murder, torture, rape, and inhuman conditions caused thousands of deaths and endless suffering at Moundsville 
Penitentiary. The Tennessee Wraith Chasers hope to trap the feuding spirits of a white supremacist and the head of 
a biker gang.

Cons.Advice: References to Violence, Supernatural Themes

04:30 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

2017 Ford Mustang GT 

A mum seeking excitement in her life wants a muscle car. The gang helps her find a used 2016 Ford Mustang GT 
and installs a few upgrades for maximum horsepower.

05:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

The Winds Of Trade 

Sea-life painter Guy Harvey enlists ATM to build a nearly 40,000-gallon aquarium for the Trade Winds Resort in St. 
Pete Beach, Florida that guests can dive into; the General threatens to retire after the way he is treated in Las 
Vegas.
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Mon Sep 18, 2023

06:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Collecting for a Cause 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

07:00 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Scuba Lights, Convertible Sandals, Racecar Simulators, and Fiberglass Doors 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how scuba lights are manufactured and 
convertible sandals are produced.

07:30 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Wood Windows, Woven Cashmere, Plastic Recyclers, and Architectural Glass 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how wood windows are manufactured and 
woven cashmere is produced.

08:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

Petrolhead Takeover 

The fans take the wheel as Mike and Ant spend the day answering questions from across the globe; they pull the 
curtain back on the inner workings of Wheeler Dealers and take look back at the last eight cars.

09:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Making History 

Take a look back at the tanks ATM has built that were inspired by moments in history, including a mob themed tank 
of the 1920's, and a 1960's Lava Lamp tank.

10:00 KILLERS OF THE COSMOS Repeat WS PG

Little Green Men 

Aliens could be lethal killers who want to invade and plunder our world; a team of experts investigate extra-terrestrial 
beings and their threat to human life.

Cons.Advice: Themes

11:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Collecting for a Cause 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

12:00 SECRET SPACE ESCAPES Repeat WS PG

Stranded 

A power failure occurs on the ISS forcing the crew to consider abandoning the station, although damage has been 
found on the shuttle that could comprise them upon reentry. During the first spacewalk a cosmonaut is nearly 
stranded after a suit malfunction.
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Mon Sep 18, 2023

13:00 EGYPT'S UNEXPLAINED FILES Repeat WS PG

Building a Superpower 

The truth behind the Ancient Egyptian superpower known today. It tells the story of the Great Pyramid at Giza, and 
how one discovery is rewriting what we now about how the pyramids were built.

14:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

Petrolhead Takeover 

The fans take the wheel as Mike and Ant spend the day answering questions from across the globe; they pull the 
curtain back on the inner workings of Wheeler Dealers and take look back at the last eight cars.

15:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Scuba Lights, Convertible Sandals, Racecar Simulators, and Fiberglass Doors 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how scuba lights are manufactured and 
convertible sandals are produced.

15:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Wood Windows, Woven Cashmere, Plastic Recyclers, and Architectural Glass 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how wood windows are manufactured and 
woven cashmere is produced.

16:00 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

Stealth Stingray 

The girls do a top-end rebuild, install an EFI, and put the factory side exhaust back on a 1969 Corvette.

16:30 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Collecting for a Cause 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

17:30 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Making History 

Take a look back at the tanks ATM has built that were inspired by moments in history, including a mob themed tank 
of the 1920's, and a 1960's Lava Lamp tank.
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Mon Sep 18, 2023

18:30 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

Petrolhead Takeover 

The fans take the wheel as Mike and Ant spend the day answering questions from across the globe; they pull the 
curtain back on the inner workings of Wheeler Dealers and take look back at the last eight cars.

19:30 BERING SEA GOLD Repeat WS M

Bad Vibrations 

The relationships between Zeke and Emily and Scott and Ian become strained; Shawn sends a crewmember 
packing; Scott invites Steve back.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Some Violence

20:30 OUTBACK OPAL HUNTERS PG

It's the final week of the season and one team makes a huge discovery! The Bushmen to hire a rookie miner, while 
the Opal Whisperers chase big money.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

21:30 GOLD RUSH WS M

New Blood 

Tony Beets, The Viking, buys a 75-year-old gold catching dredge. Plus, Todd Hoffman is left a broken man without a 
crew and with no plans to mine.

Cons.Advice: Frequent Coarse Language, Themes

22:30 GOLD RUSH WS M

From the Ashes 

While Todd gets his wash plant stuck in a river, Tony nearly crushes his son beneath a conveyor. Plus, Parker is 
forced to mine a swamp.

Cons.Advice: Frequent Coarse Language, Themes

23:30 BERING SEA GOLD Repeat WS M

Bad Vibrations 

The relationships between Zeke and Emily and Scott and Ian become strained; Shawn sends a crewmember 
packing; Scott invites Steve back.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Some Violence

00:30 OUTBACK OPAL HUNTERS Repeat PG

It's the final week of the season and one team makes a huge discovery! The Bushmen to hire a rookie miner, while 
the Opal Whisperers chase big money.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

01:30 GOLD RUSH Repeat WS M

New Blood 

Tony Beets, The Viking, buys a 75-year-old gold catching dredge. Plus, Todd Hoffman is left a broken man without a 
crew and with no plans to mine.

Cons.Advice: Frequent Coarse Language, Themes
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Mon Sep 18, 2023

02:30 GOLD RUSH Repeat WS M

From the Ashes 

While Todd gets his wash plant stuck in a river, Tony nearly crushes his son beneath a conveyor. Plus, Parker is 
forced to mine a swamp.

Cons.Advice: Frequent Coarse Language, Themes

03:30 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Collecting for a Cause 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

04:30 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

Stealth Stingray 

The girls do a top-end rebuild, install an EFI, and put the factory side exhaust back on a 1969 Corvette.

05:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Making History 

Take a look back at the tanks ATM has built that were inspired by moments in history, including a mob themed tank 
of the 1920's, and a 1960's Lava Lamp tank.
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Tue Sep 19, 2023

06:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Raising Steam 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

07:00 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Gas Barbecues, Mattress Pads, and Ear Prostheses 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how gas barbecues are manufactured and 
mattress pads are produced.

07:30 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Recycled Skateboards, Braided Pastry, Construction Trailers, and Vises 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how skateboards are manufactured and braided 
pastry is produced.

08:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1976 Mercury Capri Mk2 

Mike finds a rare beast, a 1976 Mark 2 Mercury Capri with the classic 2.8 liter Cologne V6; it's not without its 
problems, which means Ant has to completely overhaul the engine, the interior, and his own design upgrade.

09:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Pete Rose Scores A Tank 

Baseball Legend Pete Rose wants an aquarium theme to his historic baseball career, Hilarity ensues with his crazy 
witch of a fiancee won't let him put it in the house and banishes him to the porch.

10:00 EGYPT'S UNEXPLAINED FILES Repeat WS PG

Building a Superpower 

The truth behind the Ancient Egyptian superpower known today. It tells the story of the Great Pyramid at Giza, and 
how one discovery is rewriting what we now about how the pyramids were built.

11:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Raising Steam 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

12:00 OUTBACK OPAL HUNTERS Repeat PG

It's the final week of the season and one team makes a huge discovery! The Bushmen to hire a rookie miner, while 
the Opal Whisperers chase big money.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

13:00 NASA'S UNEXPLAINED FILES Repeat WS PG

Vanishing Spaceman 

A look is taken at exclusive NASA footage and firsthand accounts of mysterious flying objects from astronauts and 
scientists.

Cons.Advice: Themes
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This document is confidential and is the copyright of Nine Network Australia Pty. Ltd. This document or 
its contents must not be disclosed or released to any third party before the Embargo Date.

Page 9 of 28

Sydney Program Guide



Tue Sep 19, 2023

14:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1976 Mercury Capri Mk2 

Mike finds a rare beast, a 1976 Mark 2 Mercury Capri with the classic 2.8 liter Cologne V6; it's not without its 
problems, which means Ant has to completely overhaul the engine, the interior, and his own design upgrade.

15:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Gas Barbecues, Mattress Pads, and Ear Prostheses 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how gas barbecues are manufactured and 
mattress pads are produced.

15:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Recycled Skateboards, Braided Pastry, Construction Trailers, and Vises 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how skateboards are manufactured and braided 
pastry is produced.

16:00 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

2018 Kia Stinger GT 

The owner of a 2018 Kia Stinger GT wants some aftermarket goodies installed; the crew makes this beast into a 
monster with upgraded exhaust, a new cold-air intake and a couple of other surprises.

16:30 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Raising Steam 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

17:30 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Pete Rose Scores A Tank 

Baseball Legend Pete Rose wants an aquarium theme to his historic baseball career, Hilarity ensues with his crazy 
witch of a fiancee won't let him put it in the house and banishes him to the porch.
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Tue Sep 19, 2023

18:30 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1976 Mercury Capri Mk2 

Mike finds a rare beast, a 1976 Mark 2 Mercury Capri with the classic 2.8 liter Cologne V6; it's not without its 
problems, which means Ant has to completely overhaul the engine, the interior, and his own design upgrade.

19:30 TBA Captioned WS G

Information To Follow.

20:30 NAKED AND AFRAID XL WS M

EJ's Ball and Pain 

A brutal injury threatens EJ's challenge and manhood; Jeff and Steven are stalked by a territorial black bear; Rylie, 
Matt and Ryan land their second huge win of the challenge; Max and Gary plan a risky raid of an active beehive.

Cons.Advice: Adult Themes, Some Coarse Language, Nudity

22:30 RAILROAD ALASKA Repeat WS PG

Night From Hell 

After an accident, Jim James attempts to reach the hospital by train, but obstacles may put him in jeopardy; the 
freight crew fights to open up a port in lockdown.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

23:30 TBA Captioned WS G

Information To Follow.

00:30 NAKED AND AFRAID XL Repeat WS M

EJ's Ball and Pain 

A brutal injury threatens EJ's challenge and manhood; Jeff and Steven are stalked by a territorial black bear; Rylie, 
Matt and Ryan land their second huge win of the challenge; Max and Gary plan a risky raid of an active beehive.

Cons.Advice: Adult Themes, Some Coarse Language, Nudity

02:30 RAILROAD ALASKA Repeat WS PG

Night From Hell 

After an accident, Jim James attempts to reach the hospital by train, but obstacles may put him in jeopardy; the 
freight crew fights to open up a port in lockdown.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

03:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Gas Barbecues, Mattress Pads, and Ear Prostheses 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how gas barbecues are manufactured and 
mattress pads are produced.

04:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Recycled Skateboards, Braided Pastry, Construction Trailers, and Vises 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how skateboards are manufactured and braided 
pastry is produced.
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Tue Sep 19, 2023

04:30 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

2018 Kia Stinger GT 

The owner of a 2018 Kia Stinger GT wants some aftermarket goodies installed; the crew makes this beast into a 
monster with upgraded exhaust, a new cold-air intake and a couple of other surprises.

05:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Pete Rose Scores A Tank 

Baseball Legend Pete Rose wants an aquarium theme to his historic baseball career, Hilarity ensues with his crazy 
witch of a fiancee won't let him put it in the house and banishes him to the porch.

PLEASE NOTE: This document and its contents are embargoed until 9:00 AM Sunday 10 September 2023. 
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Wed Sep 20, 2023

06:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Shopping the Past 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

07:00 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Plasma Gems, Special Effects Snow, and Piano Restoration 

More everyday items are put under the microscope, with a look at how plasma gems are manufactured and how 
special effects snow is made.

07:30 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

3-Wheel Electric Bikes, Skin Cream, Patio Heaters, and Wood-Spoke Wheels 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how three-wheel electric bikes are manufactured 
and skin cream is made.

08:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1995 Volvo 850 T-5r Wagon 

Mike finds a true Swedish Unicorn of the car world: a '95 Volvo 850 T-5R, a station wagon with a racing pedigree; 
unfortunately the Turbo in the T-5R is in need of TLC and some leftfield thinking is needed from both guys to solve 
the bodywork issues.

09:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Medieval Protection 

A Californian family wants a medieval tank filled with crystals, gems and a dragon on top to guard their treasures; 
owners of military replica store taps the ATM crew for a WWII army tank.

10:00 TBA Captioned WS G

Information To Follow.

11:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Shopping the Past 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

12:00 RAILROAD ALASKA Repeat WS PG

Night From Hell 

After an accident, Jim James attempts to reach the hospital by train, but obstacles may put him in jeopardy; the 
freight crew fights to open up a port in lockdown.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

13:00 EGYPT'S UNEXPLAINED FILES Repeat WS PG

Death and the Afterlife 

An exploration of the ancient Egyptian obsession with death and the afterlife, including the secrets behind Egyptians' 
worship of the pyramid shape.
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Wed Sep 20, 2023

14:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1995 Volvo 850 T-5r Wagon 

Mike finds a true Swedish Unicorn of the car world: a '95 Volvo 850 T-5R, a station wagon with a racing pedigree; 
unfortunately the Turbo in the T-5R is in need of TLC and some leftfield thinking is needed from both guys to solve 
the bodywork issues.

15:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Plasma Gems, Special Effects Snow, and Piano Restoration 

More everyday items are put under the microscope, with a look at how plasma gems are manufactured and how 
special effects snow is made.

15:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

3-Wheel Electric Bikes, Skin Cream, Patio Heaters, and Wood-Spoke Wheels 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how three-wheel electric bikes are manufactured 
and skin cream is made.

16:00 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

442 Tribute Car 

A 1971 Oldsmobile Cutlass has a few issues with leaks and power loss. The crew tracks down the problems, and 
then converts the transmission from automatic to manual so the owner can drive a classic as it was meant to be 
enjoyed.

16:30 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Shopping the Past 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

17:30 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Medieval Protection 

A Californian family wants a medieval tank filled with crystals, gems and a dragon on top to guard their treasures; 
owners of military replica store taps the ATM crew for a WWII army tank.

PLEASE NOTE: This document and its contents are embargoed until 9:00 AM Sunday 10 September 2023. 
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Wed Sep 20, 2023

18:30 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1995 Volvo 850 T-5r Wagon 

Mike finds a true Swedish Unicorn of the car world: a '95 Volvo 850 T-5R, a station wagon with a racing pedigree; 
unfortunately the Turbo in the T-5R is in need of TLC and some leftfield thinking is needed from both guys to solve 
the bodywork issues.

19:30 MOTORWAY COPS: CATCHING BRITAIN'S 
SPEEDERS WS PG

Narrator Nicky Campbell reveals how an elite team of motorway police officers in Cheshire attempt to keep the 
roads safe for Britain's drivers

Cons.Advice: Dangerous Behaviour, Drug References

20:30 TRAFFIC COPS ON THE EDGE WS M

In York, PCs Chris Howarth and Steve Harvey are backed up by a police unit armed with tasers when they set out to 
arrest a man suspected of assaulting a pregnant woman.

Cons.Advice: Frequent Coarse Language, Adult Themes, Disturbing Scenes

21:30 TEXAS METAL Repeat WS M

Extra Large & Supercharged 

With dozens of awards on their walls, crowds of adoring fans, and a several months long waitlist, this Texas team 
always has their hands full with rowdy customers, challenging builds and tight timelines.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

22:30 FASTEST CARS IN THE DIRTY SOUTH WS M

Fast Focus 

The 256 takes a young racer who is losing a lot this racing season and tries to turn him into a success at one of 
Alabama's biggest grudge race events.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Some Violence

23:30 MOTORWAY COPS: CATCHING BRITAIN'S 
SPEEDERS Repeat WS PG

Narrator Nicky Campbell reveals how an elite team of motorway police officers in Cheshire attempt to keep the 
roads safe for Britain's drivers

Cons.Advice: Dangerous Behaviour, Drug References

00:30 TRAFFIC COPS ON THE EDGE Repeat WS M

In York, PCs Chris Howarth and Steve Harvey are backed up by a police unit armed with tasers when they set out to 
arrest a man suspected of assaulting a pregnant woman.

Cons.Advice: Frequent Coarse Language, Adult Themes, Disturbing Scenes

01:30 TEXAS METAL Repeat WS M

Extra Large & Supercharged 

With dozens of awards on their walls, crowds of adoring fans, and a several months long waitlist, this Texas team 
always has their hands full with rowdy customers, challenging builds and tight timelines.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language
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Wed Sep 20, 2023

02:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Plasma Gems, Special Effects Snow, and Piano Restoration 

More everyday items are put under the microscope, with a look at how plasma gems are manufactured and how 
special effects snow is made.

03:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

3-Wheel Electric Bikes, Skin Cream, Patio Heaters, and Wood-Spoke Wheels 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how three-wheel electric bikes are manufactured 
and skin cream is made.

03:30 FASTEST CARS IN THE DIRTY SOUTH Repeat WS M

Fast Focus 

The 256 takes a young racer who is losing a lot this racing season and tries to turn him into a success at one of 
Alabama's biggest grudge race events.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Some Violence

04:30 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

442 Tribute Car 

A 1971 Oldsmobile Cutlass has a few issues with leaks and power loss. The crew tracks down the problems, and 
then converts the transmission from automatic to manual so the owner can drive a classic as it was meant to be 
enjoyed.

05:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Medieval Protection 

A Californian family wants a medieval tank filled with crystals, gems and a dragon on top to guard their treasures; 
owners of military replica store taps the ATM crew for a WWII army tank.

PLEASE NOTE: This document and its contents are embargoed until 9:00 AM Sunday 10 September 2023. 
This document is confidential and is the copyright of Nine Network Australia Pty. Ltd. This document or 
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Thu Sep 21, 2023

06:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Castle Curios 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

07:00 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Wild West Holsters, Water Video Housings, Soy Drinks, and Pet Nail Trimmers 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how wild west holsters are manufactured and 
water video housings are made.

07:30 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Wood Garage Doors, Sand and Salt Spreaders, and Animatronic Dinosaurs 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how wood garage doors are manufactured and 
animatronic dinosaurs are made.

08:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1991 Toyota MR2 Turbo 

Mike gets his hands on the Japanese Ferrari, also known as a 1991 Toyota MR2 Turbo; one small fix becomes a 
big problem for Ant as the entire engine has to be removed.

09:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

The Pirate Queen 

Drag queen Frank Marino wants an over-the-top bed tank for the Vegas bedding store Holy Sheets and Brett gets 
distracted looking for buried pirate treasure as they are supposed to build a tank for a pirate ship in Perdido Key, 
Florida.

10:00 GARAGE SQUAD Repeat WS PG

Santa's New Sleigh 

The elves fix a 1930s era rat rods into Santa's sleigh to deliver goods during the holidays.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

11:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Castle Curios 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

12:00 EXPEDITION UNKNOWN Repeat WS PG

The Quest for El Dorado Part 1 

Josh Gates treks into Colombia's deadly jungle to unravel the El Dorado myth and retrace the steps of Spanish 
conquistadors; Josh meets with the tribe that inspired the legend of a city of gold and unearths its treasure in a 
surprising location.

Cons.Advice: Some Violence, Drug Use
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Thu Sep 21, 2023

13:00 MOTORWAY COPS: CATCHING BRITAIN'S 
SPEEDERS Repeat WS PG

Narrator Nicky Campbell reveals how an elite team of motorway police officers in Cheshire attempt to keep the 
roads safe for Britain's drivers

Cons.Advice: Dangerous Behaviour, Drug References

14:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1991 Toyota MR2 Turbo 

Mike gets his hands on the Japanese Ferrari, also known as a 1991 Toyota MR2 Turbo; one small fix becomes a 
big problem for Ant as the entire engine has to be removed.

15:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Wild West Holsters, Water Video Housings, Soy Drinks, and Pet Nail Trimmers 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how wild west holsters are manufactured and 
water video housings are made.

15:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Wood Garage Doors, Sand and Salt Spreaders, and Animatronic Dinosaurs 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how wood garage doors are manufactured and 
animatronic dinosaurs are made.

16:00 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

2003 BMW 325i 

A 2003 BMW 325i needs a new timing chain and has a parasitic electrical draw; each of these issues requires 
special tools to fix, but they're nothing the team can't handle.

16:30 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Castle Curios 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

17:30 TANKED Repeat WS PG

The Pirate Queen 

Drag queen Frank Marino wants an over-the-top bed tank for the Vegas bedding store Holy Sheets and Brett gets 
distracted looking for buried pirate treasure as they are supposed to build a tank for a pirate ship in Perdido Key, 
Florida.
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Thu Sep 21, 2023

18:30 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1991 Toyota MR2 Turbo 

Mike gets his hands on the Japanese Ferrari, also known as a 1991 Toyota MR2 Turbo; one small fix becomes a 
big problem for Ant as the entire engine has to be removed.

19:30 KINDIG CUSTOMS Repeat WS PG

On the Road Again 

Dave and Kevin take the show on the road to Loveland, Colo., where they hope to capture a major award for the 
Copper Caddy and Mischief, a 1952 Pontiac; a 1966 Chevelle arrives for upholstery and an engine upgrade.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

20:30 FAST 'N LOUD WS M

Motorcycle Mayhem/Packing a Packard for Pebble - Part 2 

With Richard away at the elite Concours d'Elegance, the monkeys race to complete their motorcycles in their big 
build-off.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

21:30 IRON RESURRECTION Repeat WS PG

Triple Black Cadillac 

Joe believes that wide wheels and a killer paint job will attract customers to a 1964 Cadillac Coupe Deville 
convertible, but hidden rust on the vehicle threatens to spoil his planned improvements.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

22:30 STREET OUTLAWS M

Boosted to the Max 

A familiar face returns to the 405's list, bringing with him a new car with scary potential; working on his own, Shawn 
tries to prove to his son he has what it takes to climb the ranks.

Cons.Advice: Adult Themes, Some Coarse Language

23:30 KINDIG CUSTOMS Repeat WS PG

On the Road Again 

Dave and Kevin take the show on the road to Loveland, Colo., where they hope to capture a major award for the 
Copper Caddy and Mischief, a 1952 Pontiac; a 1966 Chevelle arrives for upholstery and an engine upgrade.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

00:30 FAST 'N LOUD Repeat WS M

Motorcycle Mayhem/Packing a Packard for Pebble - Part 2 

With Richard away at the elite Concours d'Elegance, the monkeys race to complete their motorcycles in their big 
build-off.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

01:30 IRON RESURRECTION Repeat WS PG

Triple Black Cadillac 

Joe believes that wide wheels and a killer paint job will attract customers to a 1964 Cadillac Coupe Deville 
convertible, but hidden rust on the vehicle threatens to spoil his planned improvements.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language
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Thu Sep 21, 2023

02:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Wild West Holsters, Water Video Housings, Soy Drinks, and Pet Nail Trimmers 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how wild west holsters are manufactured and 
water video housings are made.

03:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Wood Garage Doors, Sand and Salt Spreaders, and Animatronic Dinosaurs 

More everyday items are put under the microscope as we discover how wood garage doors are manufactured and 
animatronic dinosaurs are made.

03:30 STREET OUTLAWS Repeat M

Boosted to the Max 

A familiar face returns to the 405's list, bringing with him a new car with scary potential; working on his own, Shawn 
tries to prove to his son he has what it takes to climb the ranks.

Cons.Advice: Adult Themes, Some Coarse Language

04:30 ALL GIRLS GARAGE Repeat WS PG

2003 BMW 325i 

A 2003 BMW 325i needs a new timing chain and has a parasitic electrical draw; each of these issues requires 
special tools to fix, but they're nothing the team can't handle.

05:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

The Pirate Queen 

Drag queen Frank Marino wants an over-the-top bed tank for the Vegas bedding store Holy Sheets and Brett gets 
distracted looking for buried pirate treasure as they are supposed to build a tank for a pirate ship in Perdido Key, 
Florida.
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Fri Sep 22, 2023

06:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

King of the Salvage Yard 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

07:00 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Grammy Awards, Bike Lights, Above-Ground Pools, and Foldable Solar Panels 

Examines how items such as Grammy Awards, bicycle lights, above-ground pools, and foldable solar panels are 
made.

07:30 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

LED Stage Lights, Apple Cider, Chemical Tank Trailers, and Stone Floors 

Examines how items such as LED stage lights, apple cider, chemical tank trailers, and ornate stone floors are made.

08:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

2002 Corvette C5 Z06 

Mike finds a 2002 Chevrolet Corvette Z06 with over 400 hp and zero to 60 in under four seconds; it's a road-legal 
race car, but Ant is less than enthused when he realizes the scale of the work needed to help it regain those 
impressive numbers.

09:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Pipe Dreams 

ATM's largest tank to date; close to 95,000 litres of water fill two connecting tanks for a Florida attraction in where 
people can swim with sharks.

10:00 KINDIG CUSTOMS Repeat WS PG

On the Road Again 

Dave and Kevin take the show on the road to Loveland, Colo., where they hope to capture a major award for the 
Copper Caddy and Mischief, a 1952 Pontiac; a 1966 Chevelle arrives for upholstery and an engine upgrade.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

11:00 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

King of the Salvage Yard 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

12:00 EGYPT'S UNEXPLAINED FILES Repeat WS PG

Death and the Afterlife 

An exploration of the ancient Egyptian obsession with death and the afterlife, including the secrets behind Egyptians' 
worship of the pyramid shape.

13:00 IRON RESURRECTION Repeat WS PG

Triple Black Cadillac 

Joe believes that wide wheels and a killer paint job will attract customers to a 1964 Cadillac Coupe Deville 
convertible, but hidden rust on the vehicle threatens to spoil his planned improvements.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language
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Fri Sep 22, 2023

14:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

2002 Corvette C5 Z06 

Mike finds a 2002 Chevrolet Corvette Z06 with over 400 hp and zero to 60 in under four seconds; it's a road-legal 
race car, but Ant is less than enthused when he realizes the scale of the work needed to help it regain those 
impressive numbers.

15:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Grammy Awards, Bike Lights, Above-Ground Pools, and Foldable Solar Panels 

Examines how items such as Grammy Awards, bicycle lights, above-ground pools, and foldable solar panels are 
made.

15:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

LED Stage Lights, Apple Cider, Chemical Tank Trailers, and Stone Floors 

Examines how items such as LED stage lights, apple cider, chemical tank trailers, and ornate stone floors are made.

16:00 CAR FIX WS TBC

'80s Restore 

Jared and Lou take an '87 Grand National and redo the headliner, carpet and a few other parts that just became 
available for these cars.

16:30 SALVAGE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

King of the Salvage Yard 

Meet modern-day treasure hunter Drew Pritchard. With demanding customers, high turnover, and one of the biggest 
decorative salvage yards in the UK, Drew is constantly on the road, crisscrossing the country in search of derelict 
gems and forgotten remnants.

17:30 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Pipe Dreams 

ATM's largest tank to date; close to 95,000 litres of water fill two connecting tanks for a Florida attraction in where 
people can swim with sharks.

PLEASE NOTE: This document and its contents are embargoed until 9:00 AM Sunday 10 September 2023. 
This document is confidential and is the copyright of Nine Network Australia Pty. Ltd. This document or 
its contents must not be disclosed or released to any third party before the Embargo Date.

Page 22 of 28

Sydney Program Guide



Fri Sep 22, 2023

18:30 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

2002 Corvette C5 Z06 

Mike finds a 2002 Chevrolet Corvette Z06 with over 400 hp and zero to 60 in under four seconds; it's a road-legal 
race car, but Ant is less than enthused when he realizes the scale of the work needed to help it regain those 
impressive numbers.

19:30 MYSTERIES AT THE MUSEUM WS PG

Carnival of Naked Animals, Melon Heads, Worst Video Game 

Host Don Wildman examines a velvet painting of a unicorn wearing shorts, a skull that shows symptoms of a rare 
condition, and a cartridge that contains what some say is the worst video game ever.

Cons.Advice: Themes

20:30 EXPEDITION UNKNOWN WS PG

Uncovering the Golden City Part 2 

The hunt for El Dorado is Josh's most grueling journey ever, and one of the crew tumbles into a raging river; when 
cutting-edge aerial scans reveal a lost city, the crew pushes into the jungle to uncover El Dorado and the gold that 
comes with it.

Cons.Advice: Some Violence

21:30 ALASKAN KILLER BIGFOOT Repeat WS M

An Unhappy Medium 

A medium joins the expedition to build a spiritual bridge with Nantinaq, but when she senses a dark and deadly 
presence, she immediately panics.

Cons.Advice: Supernatural Themes, References to Violence, Some Coarse Language

22:30 HOW THE UNIVERSE WORKS Repeat WS PG

The Dark Matter Enigma 

Dark matter is the biggest mystery of the cosmos. Scientists know that it has been vital to the universe since its 
birth, new discoveries reveal that it could create black holes, cause mass extinctions, and might even have helped 
to shape life on the Earth. 

Cons.Advice: Themes

23:30 MYSTERIES AT THE MUSEUM Repeat WS PG

Carnival of Naked Animals, Melon Heads, Worst Video Game 

Host Don Wildman examines a velvet painting of a unicorn wearing shorts, a skull that shows symptoms of a rare 
condition, and a cartridge that contains what some say is the worst video game ever.

Cons.Advice: Themes

00:30 EXPEDITION UNKNOWN Repeat WS PG

Uncovering the Golden City Part 2 

The hunt for El Dorado is Josh's most grueling journey ever, and one of the crew tumbles into a raging river; when 
cutting-edge aerial scans reveal a lost city, the crew pushes into the jungle to uncover El Dorado and the gold that 
comes with it.

Cons.Advice: Some Violence
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Fri Sep 22, 2023

01:30 ALASKAN KILLER BIGFOOT Repeat WS M

An Unhappy Medium 

A medium joins the expedition to build a spiritual bridge with Nantinaq, but when she senses a dark and deadly 
presence, she immediately panics.

Cons.Advice: Supernatural Themes, References to Violence, Some Coarse Language

02:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Grammy Awards, Bike Lights, Above-Ground Pools, and Foldable Solar Panels 

Examines how items such as Grammy Awards, bicycle lights, above-ground pools, and foldable solar panels are 
made.

03:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

LED Stage Lights, Apple Cider, Chemical Tank Trailers, and Stone Floors 

Examines how items such as LED stage lights, apple cider, chemical tank trailers, and ornate stone floors are made.

03:30 HOW THE UNIVERSE WORKS Repeat WS PG

The Dark Matter Enigma 

Dark matter is the biggest mystery of the cosmos. Scientists know that it has been vital to the universe since its 
birth, new discoveries reveal that it could create black holes, cause mass extinctions, and might even have helped 
to shape life on the Earth. 

Cons.Advice: Themes

04:30 CAR FIX Repeat WS TBC

'80s Restore 

Jared and Lou take an '87 Grand National and redo the headliner, carpet and a few other parts that just became 
available for these cars.

05:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

Pipe Dreams 

ATM's largest tank to date; close to 95,000 litres of water fill two connecting tanks for a Florida attraction in where 
people can swim with sharks.
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Sat Sep 23, 2023

06:00 EGYPT'S UNEXPLAINED FILES Repeat WS PG

Death and the Afterlife 

An exploration of the ancient Egyptian obsession with death and the afterlife, including the secrets behind Egyptians' 
worship of the pyramid shape.

07:00 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Fishing Line, Industrial Mixers, Natural Baking Soda, and Tow Trucks 

Examines how items such as fishing line, industrial mixers, natural baking soda, and tow trucks are made.

07:30 HOW IT'S MADE WS PG

Storage Sheds, Industrial Fans, Parchment Paper, and Climbing Walls 

Examines how storage sheds, industrial fans, parchment paper and climbing walls are made for the general 
population.

08:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1991 Alfa Romeo 164l 

Mike tracks down a rare '91 Alfa Romeo 164L and loves the look of this car, but Ant has his work cut out for him; this 
Alpha has perfect bodywork, but it has a leaking engine, faulty steering, dodgy brakes and a host of other issues.

09:00 TANKED Repeat WS PG

The Purr-Fect Tank 

Wayde and Brett head to the Royal Blues Hotel in Florida to build a 1,500 gallon tank into the restaurant ceiling that 
would also be visible from the pool; then off to Seattle to build a tank for Henri the Cat.

10:00 HOW THE UNIVERSE WORKS Repeat WS PG

The Dark Matter Enigma 

Dark matter is the biggest mystery of the cosmos. Scientists know that it has been vital to the universe since its 
birth, new discoveries reveal that it could create black holes, cause mass extinctions, and might even have helped 
to shape life on the Earth. 

Cons.Advice: Themes

11:00 IRON RESURRECTION Repeat WS PG

Triple Black Cadillac 

Joe believes that wide wheels and a killer paint job will attract customers to a 1964 Cadillac Coupe Deville 
convertible, but hidden rust on the vehicle threatens to spoil his planned improvements.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

12:00 EXPEDITION UNKNOWN Repeat WS PG

Uncovering the Golden City Part 2 

The hunt for El Dorado is Josh's most grueling journey ever, and one of the crew tumbles into a raging river; when 
cutting-edge aerial scans reveal a lost city, the crew pushes into the jungle to uncover El Dorado and the gold that 
comes with it.

Cons.Advice: Some Violence
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Sat Sep 23, 2023

13:00 EGYPT'S UNEXPLAINED FILES Repeat WS PG

Death and the Afterlife 

An exploration of the ancient Egyptian obsession with death and the afterlife, including the secrets behind Egyptians' 
worship of the pyramid shape.

14:00 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1991 Alfa Romeo 164l 

Mike tracks down a rare '91 Alfa Romeo 164L and loves the look of this car, but Ant has his work cut out for him; this 
Alpha has perfect bodywork, but it has a leaking engine, faulty steering, dodgy brakes and a host of other issues.

15:00 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Fishing Line, Industrial Mixers, Natural Baking Soda, and Tow Trucks 

Examines how items such as fishing line, industrial mixers, natural baking soda, and tow trucks are made.

15:30 HOW IT'S MADE Repeat WS PG

Storage Sheds, Industrial Fans, Parchment Paper, and Climbing Walls 

Examines how storage sheds, industrial fans, parchment paper and climbing walls are made for the general 
population.

16:00 CAR FIX WS TBC

Barracuda Brakes 

Jared and Lou were going to do a simple brake conversion from drum to disc on a '65 Barracuda, until they saw the 
ball joints, control arm bushings and strut rod bushings; the simple brake job becomes an entire suspension rebuild.

16:30 TANKED Repeat WS PG

The Purr-Fect Tank 

Wayde and Brett head to the Royal Blues Hotel in Florida to build a 1,500 gallon tank into the restaurant ceiling that 
would also be visible from the pool; then off to Seattle to build a tank for Henri the Cat.

17:30 KINDIG CUSTOMS Repeat WS PG

On the Road Again 

Dave and Kevin take the show on the road to Loveland, Colo., where they hope to capture a major award for the 
Copper Caddy and Mischief, a 1952 Pontiac; a 1966 Chevelle arrives for upholstery and an engine upgrade.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language
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Sat Sep 23, 2023

18:30 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1991 Alfa Romeo 164l 

Mike tracks down a rare '91 Alfa Romeo 164L and loves the look of this car, but Ant has his work cut out for him; this 
Alpha has perfect bodywork, but it has a leaking engine, faulty steering, dodgy brakes and a host of other issues.

19:30 FLYING WILD ALASKA Repeat WS PG

Trick or Tweto 

Halloween in Alaska signals vicious winds that create havoc for the small planes. And will Ariel measure up when a 
blackout tests her abilities as station manager?

Cons.Advice: Themes, Mild Coarse Language

20:30 ALASKA: THE LAST FRONTIER SPECIALS WS M

Kilcher Quarantine 

As the coronavirus spreads into Alaska, the Kilcher family self-documents the quarantine and how the COVID-19 
crisis is changing life on the homestead.

Cons.Advice: Hunting Violence

21:30 ALASKAN BUSH PEOPLE Repeat WS M

Raised Wild 

A journey deep into Alaska's bush, where naturalist and adventurer Billy Brown, along with his wife, Ami, and their 
seven children, chooses to live life on his own terms, connected to wild nature and bonded to each other. 

Cons.Advice: Hunting Violence

22:30 OUTBACK OPAL HUNTERS Repeat PG

It's the final week of the season and one team makes a huge discovery! The Bushmen to hire a rookie miner, while 
the Opal Whisperers chase big money.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

23:30 ALASKA: THE LAST FRONTIER SPECIALS WS M

Kilcher Quarantine 

As the coronavirus spreads into Alaska, the Kilcher family self-documents the quarantine and how the COVID-19 
crisis is changing life on the homestead.

Cons.Advice: Hunting Violence

00:30 ALASKAN BUSH PEOPLE Repeat WS M

Raised Wild 

A journey deep into Alaska's bush, where naturalist and adventurer Billy Brown, along with his wife, Ami, and their 
seven children, chooses to live life on his own terms, connected to wild nature and bonded to each other. 

Cons.Advice: Hunting Violence

01:30 WHEELER DEALERS Repeat WS PG

1991 Alfa Romeo 164l 

Mike tracks down a rare '91 Alfa Romeo 164L and loves the look of this car, but Ant has his work cut out for him; this 
Alpha has perfect bodywork, but it has a leaking engine, faulty steering, dodgy brakes and a host of other issues.

PLEASE NOTE: This document and its contents are embargoed until 9:00 AM Sunday 10 September 2023. 
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Sat Sep 23, 2023

02:30 TANKED Repeat WS PG

The Purr-Fect Tank 

Wayde and Brett head to the Royal Blues Hotel in Florida to build a 1,500 gallon tank into the restaurant ceiling that 
would also be visible from the pool; then off to Seattle to build a tank for Henri the Cat.

03:30 ALASKA: THE LAST FRONTIER SPECIALS Repeat WS M

Kilcher Quarantine 

As the coronavirus spreads into Alaska, the Kilcher family self-documents the quarantine and how the COVID-19 
crisis is changing life on the homestead.

Cons.Advice: Hunting Violence

04:30 CAR FIX Repeat WS TBC

Barracuda Brakes 

Jared and Lou were going to do a simple brake conversion from drum to disc on a '65 Barracuda, until they saw the 
ball joints, control arm bushings and strut rod bushings; the simple brake job becomes an entire suspension rebuild.

05:00 ALASKAN BUSH PEOPLE Repeat WS M

Raised Wild 

A journey deep into Alaska's bush, where naturalist and adventurer Billy Brown, along with his wife, Ami, and their 
seven children, chooses to live life on his own terms, connected to wild nature and bonded to each other. 

Cons.Advice: Hunting Violence

PLEASE NOTE: This document and its contents are embargoed until 9:00 AM Sunday 10 September 2023. 
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